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BID OPENING: REQUEST FOR BIDS - Aluminized Steel Culvert Pipes

The County Commission requested bids to select a single Bidder to provide
the necessary quantity, quality, and dimensions of culverts and supplemental
supplies, ongoing for 2024, as listed in the specifications.

The request for bids was sent to a list of potential bidders on February 28,

COMPANY NAME|
LOCATION
RECEIVED
ORIGINAL BID
COPY OF BID
W-9

SPECIFICATIONS|

March 25, 2024

Viebrock Sales and Senice LLC

Metal Culverts

Welborn Sales, Inc

Sedalia MO Jefferson City MO Salina KS
3/20/2024 at 10:10 a.m. 3/21/2024 at 11:35 a.m. 312512024 at 1:04 p.m.
Provided Provided Provided
Provided Provided Provided
Provided Provided Provided

Will comply with all

Will comply with all

Will comply with all

: : TERMS & CONDITIONS Will comply with all Will comply with all Will comply with all
2024 and it was posted on the Johnson County MO website » - = - s
: K ). Th t for bidevwas advertised it Do e & 2z Comugated Aluminized Steel
(www.jococourthouse.com). The request for bids w vertised in the 8§ g = B E Cuherts (Addtional Requirements &
H i @ QL C . .
Warrensburg Star Journal in the March 1, 2024 printed newspaper. tem 5 E §& § & Delery Location) Price / LF Total Price | Price/LF  Total Price | Price/LF Total Price| Price/LF Total Price
. e . ; . 24a | 24 | 34 | 16] 15 [None issued by county $22.60 $11,526.00 $25.10 $12,801.00 $43.00 [$21,930.00] $43.00 [$521,930.00
uestions and clarifications were to be submitted by Bidders before 1: : :
Q oY i 30 24b | 36 | 34 | 14 | 20 [None issued by county $41.96 $28,532.80 $46.25 $31,450.00 $83.25 [$56,610.00] $83.25 [$56,610.00
p.m. (CST) on Tuesday, March 12, 2024. No questions were received and N0 [23c | 48 | 34 | 14| 15 [None issued by county $56.96 $20,040.60 | $61.75 | $31,492.50 | $111.00 |$66,610.00] $111.00 |$56,610.00
clarifications were needed so no addendum was issued. 24d | 36 | 40 | 14| 8 [None issued by county $41.96 $13,427.20 $46.25 $14,800.00 $84.00 [$26,880.00| $84.00 [$26,880.00
) . ) 24e | 48 | 40 | 14| 8 |None issued by county $56.96 $18,227.20 $61.75 $19,760.00 | $109.00 [$34,880.00| $109.00 |$34,880.00
Bids for Aluminized Steel Culvert Pipes were opened at 1:30 p.m. (CST) on 3in 1 comugation, NE 1201 Rd,
Monday, March 25, 2024, as advertised. Present at the opening: Troy 241 1 81 % 12| " north of 500" R NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID B474.00 " |323,700.00
Matthews, Presiding Commissioner; John Marr, Eastern Commissicner; i i st
: 9 e : 28 |2aq. o0y |12 |y [Pl conupaton, NEA201E Rd, $160.44 | $802200 | 15575 | $7.787.50 | $400.00 [$20,000.00
Charlie Kavanaugh, Western Commissioner; Jennifer Powers, County Clerk ALT North of 500" Rd
Chief Deputy; Randy Dillon, Viebrock Sales & Services; Mike Totten, Arch: 142" span x 91" rise, 3 in 1
Advanced Drainage Systems; Rob Richardson, Contech Engineered 2.4g 120 | 36.5| 10| 1 |corrugation, NE 250" Rd, East of NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,018.00 |[$37,157.00
Solutions; Bill Gonzalez, Welborn Sales. Bids were opened and read aloud. It mﬂhﬂﬁzn TR TR
) ; i s ;
"&’ESQ%%E‘:%‘“Z" the Addendum Item is to be delivered to NW 200™ Road not 1249 | 450 | 365 | 10| 1 |comugation, NE 250" Rd, East of $307.03 $11,206.60 | $319.90 | $11,676.35 | $920.00 |$33,580.00
oad.
ALT MM Hwy
Commissioner Kavanaugh motioned, and Commissioner Marr seconded to Diameter Price per band Price per band Price per Price per
take the bids under advisement. Motion approved unanimously. Item Type (inches) Bands with Bolts (Quantity) with bolts Total Price with bolts Total Price | band w/bolts Total Price | band w/bolts Total Price
2.4h Dimple 15 25 $22.60 $565.00 $29.85 $746.25 $60.00 [ $1,500.00 | $60.00 $1,500.00
COUNTY COMMISSION 2.4i Dimple 18 10 $28.76 $287.60 $32.60 $326.00 $72.00 $720.00 $72.00 $720.00
2 4] Dimple 36 10 $63.26 $632.60 $55.55 $555.50 $144.00 | $1,440.00 | $144.00 | $1,440.00
2.4k Hugger 48 20 $86.28 $1,725.60 $92.90 $1,858.00 $102.00 | $3,840.00 | $192.00 | $3,840.00
5 % ’é‘ = & g Additional Requirements & Delivery
§¢ ES D% 2 § Location: NW 200th Rd, East of
22 6E 8L & 3 251stRd Price / LF Total Price Price/LF  Total Price | Price/LF Total Price| Price/LF Total Price
24m | 78 | 60 | 14| 1 [3in 1 comugation NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i‘l‘_’: 78 | 60 [ 14| 1 [5in 1 corrugation $98.98 $5,938.80 $104.75 $6,285.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$257,990.00 does not $265,267.00 does not
Total Bid Price $129,141.00 $139,538.10 include 2.4m culvert include 2.4m culert
Response Time / Delivery 2-4 weeks 4-5 Weeks A.R.O. 2-8 weeks, depends on item




